
ArƟcle III. Membership  

SECTION 2. The membership of NAH shall consist of Individual Members, Family Members, and Life 
Members.  

Will be amended as –  

SECTION 2. The membership of NAH shall consist of general Members, Individual Life Members, and 
Family Life Members. 

 

ArƟcle XIV. Amendment to the ConsƟtuƟon and Bylaws  

SECTION 1. Amendments to this ConsƟtuƟon and Bylaws may be proposed by the ExecuƟve CommiƩee 
or by a peƟƟon containing signatures of at least ten percent of the members of NAH in good standing. 

Will be amended as –  

ArƟcle XIV. Amendment to the ConsƟtuƟon and Bylaws SECTION 1. Amendments to this ConsƟtuƟon and 
Bylaws shall be proposed by the ExecuƟve CommiƩee or by a peƟƟon containing signatures of at least 
ten percent of the Life members of NAH. 

 

By Laws –  

ArƟcle I. ElecƟon of Officers 

SECTION 2. Each member voƟng, should be a member of NAH at least thirty (30) days prior to the 
ElecƟon Day, and can cast one vote for each posiƟon. 

Will be amended as –  

SECTION 2. Each member voƟng should be a life member of NAH (individual or family) at least thirty (30) 
days prior to the ElecƟon Day and can cast one vote for each posiƟon. 

 

SECTION 5. The newly elected Officers shall begin their term one month aŌer the elecƟon date to allow 
Ɵme to transfer power in this transiƟon period from incumbent to newly-elected Officers. 

Will be amended as –  

SECTION 5. The incumbent NAH ExecuƟve CommiƩee shall duly transfer power to the newly elected 
NAH ExecuƟve CommiƩee within 90 days of the elecƟon. The transfer of power shall consist of handover 
of all NAH documents, assets, bank check books, and transfer of bank signatories. 

 

ArƟcle III. Expulsion of Members 

SECTION 1. Any officer or member of the ExecuƟve CommiƩee may be expelled by the ExecuƟve 
CommiƩee upon raƟficaƟon by the Board of Trustees for the reason of nonfeasance, malfeasance, 



conduct detrimental to the interests of NAH, lack of adherence with its objecƟves and ideals, or refusal 
to render reasonable assistance in carrying out its purposes. If such situaƟon arises, the ExecuƟve 
CommiƩee shall first consult with the Board of Trustees and obtain their concurrence, and then propose 
and secure the vote of a two-third majority of the ExecuƟve CommiƩee at a regular meeƟng to expel the 
officer or member from NAH. 

Will be amended as - 

Any officer or member of the ExecuƟve CommiƩee (EC) may be expelled by the EC upon raƟficaƟon by 
the Board of Trustees for the reason of nonfeasance, malfeasance, conduct detrimental to the interests 
of NAH, lack of adherence with its objecƟves and ideals, or refusal to render reasonable assistance in 
carrying out its purposes. If such situaƟon arises, a member of the EC can file a signed peƟƟon with the 
Board of Trustees upon geƫng signatures from one-third EC members. The Board of Trustees shall 
convene a meeƟng and secure a simple majority of Board of Trustees members present to proceed with 
the expulsion. Junior most member of Board of Trustees who is in favor (here in aŌer referred to as 
“Convener”) shall lead the process of expulsion. Convener shall call a meeƟng of the EC to deliberate and 
secure a two-third majority of EC members present to formalize the expulsion of the officer or member 
from NAH. 

 

SECTION 2. The officer or member proposed to be expelled shall be enƟtled to at least five days’ noƟce 
in wriƟng from the ExecuƟve CommiƩee giving Ɵme, date, and place of the meeƟng. At such meeƟng, 
that officer or member shall be enƟtled to appear before and heard by the Board of Trustees and the 
ExecuƟve CommiƩee. 

Will be amended as - 

SECTION 2. The officer or member proposed to be expelled shall be enƟtled to at least fiŌeen calendar 
days’ noƟce in wriƟng from the ExecuƟve CommiƩee giving Ɵme, date, and place of the meeƟng. At such 
meeƟng, that officer or member shall be enƟtled to appear before and heard by the Board of Trustees. 

 

ArƟcle IV. Membership Fee Schedule 

SECTION 1. Any adult, 18 year and older, who is qualified under SecƟon 1 of the ArƟcle III of the 

ConsƟtuƟon shall pay annual membership dues as follows: Individual Membership $10.00 and Family 
Membership $20.00. The annual Individual Life Membership dues is $200.00 and the Family Life 
Membership, $300. The Family Membership includes the husband, wife, and children below the age of 
18 years.  

Will be amended as - 

SECTION 1. Any adult, 18 year and older, who is qualified under SecƟon 1 of the ArƟcle III of the 

ConsƟtuƟon shall pay annual membership dues as follows: 

General Membership (Individual and Family Membership) shall be free of cost. The Life individual 
Membership due shall be $250.00 and the Family Life Membership due shall be $500. The Family 



Membership includes the husband, wife, and children below the age of 18 years. Only members with Life 
membership shall be allowed to vote and parƟcipate in Annual General MeeƟng voƟng including 
elecƟons. In case of separaƟon (divorce) in the 'family membership', both husband and wife shall 
become individual members. Individual member shall pay $250 to change membership status to Family 
Membership status. 

 

SECTION 2. The annual membership fee, except the Life Membership, shall be due in January every year. 

Will be amended scrapped. 

 

ArƟcle VII. Eligibility Requirements for ExecuƟve CommiƩee Candidacy 

SECTION 1. Any NAH member, 21 year and older, shall be eligible to contest in the elecƟon for the 
posiƟon of a member, or Assistant Secretary, or Assistant Treasurer in the NAH ExecuƟve CommiƩee. 

Will be amended as -  

SECTION 1. Any NAH life member, 21 year and older, shall be eligible to contest in the elecƟon for the 
posiƟon of a member, or Assistant Secretary, or Assistant Treasurer in the NAH ExecuƟve CommiƩee.  

 

SECTION 4. All newly elected officers and members of the ExecuƟve CommiƩee are required to obtain 
NAH Life Membership within 90 days of elecƟon. 

Will be amended scrapped. 

 

Article X. Meetings  
 
SECTION 1. NAH shall hold at least one meeting of the members each year, this meeting to be known as 
the General Body Meeting. 

  
Will be amended as -  

SECTION 1. NAH shall hold at least one meeting of the members each year, known as the General Body 
Meeting. The announcement of the General Body Meeting shall be sent by the NAH Executive 
Committee 30 days prior to the meeting with the agenda and a draft of the proposed NAH Constitution 
and Bylaws Amendment. 


